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Synopsis

Flash Fire is the second book in the Extraordinaries series by T.J. Klune. It
follows the story of Nick Bell, an awkward and unassuming high school
student who discovers that he has extraordinary abilities. In Flash Fire,
Nick and his friends must face their greatest challenge yet as they battle a
villain who threatens to destroy the world.

Nick Bell is an ordinary high school student who lives in the small town of
Moxyland. He's shy and awkward, and he doesn't have many friends. But
everything changes when Nick discovers that he has extraordinary abilities.
He can control fire with his mind, and he's stronger and faster than any
normal human.

Nick soon learns that he's not the only one with extraordinary abilities. He
meets a group of other teenagers who have similar powers, and together
they form the Extraordinaries. The Extraordinaries use their powers to help
people and protect the innocent.

But in Flash Fire, the Extraordinaries face their greatest challenge yet. A
villain named Pyro has emerged, and he threatens to destroy the world.
Pyro is powerful and ruthless, and he will stop at nothing to achieve his
goals.
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Nick and his friends must find a way to defeat Pyro and save the world. But
can they do it before it's too late?

Review

Flash Fire is an exciting and action-packed adventure that will keep you on
the edge of your seat from beginning to end. T.J. Klune has created a cast
of unforgettable characters, and the story is full of twists and turns that will
keep you guessing until the very end.

Nick Bell is a relatable and likeable protagonist, and it's easy to root for him
as he faces his challenges. The other members of the Extraordinaries are
also well-developed, and each of them has their own unique strengths and
weaknesses.

The villain, Pyro, is a truly menacing figure, and his motivations are
complex and believable. He's not just a one-dimensional bad guy, but a
character with his own reasons for ng what he does.

The action in Flash Fire is fast-paced and exciting, and the stakes are high.
The characters are constantly facing danger, and it's clear that they could
all die at any moment. This sense of danger adds to the excitement of the
story, and it keeps you invested in the characters' fates.

Overall, Flash Fire is an excellent book that I highly recommend. It's a fun,
exciting, and suspenseful adventure that will appeal to fans of YA fantasy
and LGBTQ+ fiction.

About the Author



T.J. Klune is an American author of contemporary fantasy and romance
novels. He is best known for his Extraordinaries series, which follows the
story of Nick Bell, a gay high school student who discovers that he has
extraordinary abilities.

Klune's writing has been praised for its humor, heart, and LGBTQ+
representation. He has won numerous awards for his work, including the
Lambda Literary Award for Best Gay Romance.

Klune lives in Seattle, Washington with his husband and their two dogs.

Buy Flash Fire

You can buy Flash Fire from Our Book Library, Barnes & Noble, or your
local bookstore.
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