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Prepare to be captivated by the extraordinary journey of Martin Dorey, an
intrepid adventurer who embarked on an epic mission to travel from
England to New Zealand using any means of transport except flying.

For six exhilarating years, Martin traversed continents, navigated
treacherous seas, and embraced unexpected adventures, all while
documenting his incredible journey in his memoir, England to New Zealand
the Hard Way.

From England to the Edge of the World

Martin's adventure began in the heart of England, where he bid farewell to
the familiar and set out on an unknown path. With a backpack filled with
essentials and an unyielding determination, he ventured into the unknown.

His journey took him through bustling cities, serene countrysides, and
rugged terrains. He hitchhiked across Europe, sailed across the Atlantic
Ocean, and trekked through the unforgiving wilderness of South America.

Along the way, Martin encountered a kaleidoscope of characters, from
friendly locals to eccentric travelers. Each encounter enriched his journey,
adding depth and color to his extraordinary tale.
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Sailing the Treacherous Seas

A pivotal moment in Martin's odyssey was his daring decision to cross the
Atlantic Ocean on a small sailboat. With limited sailing experience, he
braved towering waves, unpredictable weather, and countless sleepless
nights.

His account of the voyage is both awe-inspiring and humbling. He vividly
captures the beauty and ferocity of the ocean, revealing the immense
courage and resilience that fueled his adventure.

Trekking Through the Our Book Library

After navigating the Atlantic, Martin set foot on the shores of South
America. Undeterred by the dense rainforest and lurking dangers, he
embarked on a treacherous trek through the Our Book Library jungle.

He faced relentless rain, poisonous creatures, and the solitude of the
uncharted wilderness. Yet, amidst the challenges, he discovered
unexpected beauty and a profound connection to the natural world.

The Final Leg: New Zealand Bound

As Martin approached the end of his epic journey, he found himself in the
vast expanse of the Pacific Ocean. Aboard a cargo ship, he endured weeks
of monotony and isolation.

Finally, after six unforgettable years, Martin set foot on the shores of New
Zealand. His arrival marked the culmination of an extraordinary odyssey, a
testament to the human spirit's boundless capacity for adventure and
perseverance.



Beyond the Adventure: Lessons Learned

England to New Zealand the Hard Way is not just a travelogue; it is a
poignant reflection on the transformative power of adventure. Martin's
journey taught him invaluable lessons about resilience, adaptability, and the
importance of human connection.

Through his engaging storytelling and captivating photographs, Martin
invites readers to join him on his incredible journey. His book is a must-read
for anyone who dreams of adventure, seeks inspiration, or simply wants to
lose themselves in a thrilling tale of human endurance.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Embark on the adventure of a lifetime with England to New Zealand the
Hard Way. Free Download your copy today and experience the
extraordinary journey that will leave you breathless.

Available in bookstores and online retailers.
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